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Chris brings over 25 years of leading effective teams, forming dynamic leaders, and cultivating 
healthy organizations. He has worked with teams in Europe, Mexico, Haiti and across the US. 
Chris is passionate about the transformative power of organizational health. He believes in the 
power and giftedness of the human person and helps leaders maximize human potential both 
for themselves and for their teams. Healthy team members thrive and healthy teams win. 
Chris teaches the certification class for the Six Types of Working Genius assessment.


Before The Table Group, Chris was a foreign missionary, non-profit executive, cultural 
entrepreneur and leadership consultant. After graduating from Notre Dame with a finance 
degree, Chris worked in financial management for a Fortune 500 company. Moved to answer 
the call to ministry, Chris left the corporate world and spent the next several years serving as 
the Youth Minister of his local church. Chris met his wife, Michelle through foreign missions 
and soon after, Chris and his family relocated abroad to begin work as a missionary family. 
Eventually returning back to the United States and settling in Georgia, Chris served as the 
Director of Camps and Missions for Life Teen. Under Chris' team-centered leadership, the 
summer camp program grew from 200 campers per summer to over 4,000 campers per 
summer. Chris used Pat Lencioni’s book, The Advantage, to build cohesive teams aligned a 
common mission resulting in exponential growth.


Chris is committed to his faith, his family, and his mission. Chris and his wife Michelle are 
proud parents of four boys and two girls, two of whom were adopted from Haiti in 2011. 
Currently, Chris is the President of Greenhouse Collective, a non-profit committed to growing 
small faith communities and cultivating healthy family circles. He is inspired by Mother Theresa 
who said, “The problem with our world is that we draw the circle of family too small.” Whether 
it is biological family, a group of neighbors, or an executive team, Chris works to build healthy 
teams who maximize their human potential to impact the world.

Contact Info: 

p: 850.879.4440

e: chris.benzinger@tablegroupconsulting.com


Partial Client List
▪ University of Notre Dame

▪ ZeroNox

▪ Prolacta BioScience

▪ John Burns Construction 

▪ Academy of the Holy Names

▪ Lockheed Martin

▪ Florida Department of Children and 

Families


